RESOLUTION OF THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE THREE AFFILIATED TRIBES OF THE FORT BERTHOLD RESERVATION

- WHEREAS, This Nation having accepted the Indian Reorganization Act of June 18, 1934, and the authority under said Act; and
- WHEREAS, The Constitution of the Three Affiliated Tribes generally authorizes and empowers the Tribal Business Council to engage in activities on behalf of and in the interest of the welfare and benefit of the Tribes and Tribal members; and
- WHEREAS, The Three Affiliated Tribes' Tribal Business Council has reviewed the invoices for services rendered by the law firm of Hobbs, Strauss, Dean & Wilder for the months of September, 1986 thru February, 1989 in the total amount of \$ 11,358.24.
- WHEREAS, The Three Affiliated Tribes' has already issued a check in the amount of \$ 7,350.00 on December 20, 1988 as a payment against this outstanding balance with the understanding that this resolution would be prepared and submitted to the Bureau of Indian Affairs for approval; and
- WHEREAS, The Three Affiliated Tribes' do not accept the charges for those costs labelled as item D. for a total of \$ 185.68 on the February 27, 1989 invoice because all costs being invoiced this period were on fixed ceiling budgets.
- NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, That the Three Affiliated Tribes' Tribal Business Council hereby approves, and requests the Secretary of the Department of Interior to accept, the invoices attached for services rendered by the law firm of Hobbs, Strauss, Dean & Wilder for the months of September, 1986 thru February, 1989 in the total amount of \$ 11,358.24 (Invoices attached).
- BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED. That the Three Affiliated Tribes' shall issue a check in the amount of \$ 4,008.24 to the law firm of Hobbs, Strauss, Dean & Wilder upon approval of this resolution from the Secretary of the Department of Interior.
- BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED. That the payment shall be charged as follows:

T-2 Budget \$ 3,008.24 (Re burial Project)

Tribal Finance 1,000.00 (638 Project)

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the requested increase in the billing rate from \$ 100.00 an hour to \$ 110.00 is hereby denied due to budgetary constraints not within the Tribes' control.

CERTIFICATION

| I, the undersigned, as Secretary of the Tribal Business Council of the Three Affiliated Tribes of the Fort Berthold Reservation, hereby certify that the Tribal Business Council is composed of 7 members of whom 5 constitutes a quorum, Mover present at a Regular meeting thereof duly called, noticed, convened, and held on the Math day of May 1989; that the foregoing Resolution was duly adopted at such meeting by the affirmative vote of Movembers, Movembers opposed, Movembers abstained, Movembers not voting, and that said Resolution has not been rescinded or amended in any |
|---|
| way. |
| Chairman Not Voting |
| Dated this 11th day of May, 1989. Secretary, Tribal Business Council |

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100 TELECOPIER (202) 296-8834

PORTLAND OFFICE:

0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6

PORTLAND, OREGON 97201

(503) 242-0705

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC)
MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
DEAN B. SUAGEE (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS RO. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

February 27, 1989

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & ASSOCIATES RO. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)
OF COUNSEL

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

Christopher Quale, Esq.
Three Affiliated Tribes of
the Ft. Berthold Reservation
New Town, North Dakota 58763

Dear Kip:

Enclosed is our bill for December and January. The computer does not break it down into components, but we have done so as follows:

A. Yakima Case Amicus Brief -- \$0

We spent 5.8 more hours on this, but there is no further charge as our budget was \$4,000, which we billed and you paid.

B. Reburial Project -- \$3,000

| | Hours | <u>Rate</u> | Bill |
|---------------|-------|-------------|---------|
| Dean Suagee | 28.70 | \$110 | \$3,157 |
| Karen Funk | 3.70 | \$ 70 | 259 |
| Charlie Hobbs | _1.00 | \$110 | 110 |
| | 33.40 | | \$3,526 |

Our agreed budget for this project was \$3,000, which we are hereby billing. There will be no further charges on the Reburial Project, though there will necessarily be a little more time finishing it up.

C. 638 Project -- \$1,000

We spent considerable time on the 638 Amendments for eight clients, including Fort Berthold. Fort Berthold's allocated one-eighth share for January and December was 13.4 hours (mostly Bobo Dean). At the contract rate this comes

Christopher Quale, Esq. February 27, 1989 Page No. 2

to \$1,474. However, our budget ceiling was \$1,000 through March, so we will waive the \$474 and bill only \$1,000. There will be more work in February and March, but we will not charge you for it.

D. Expenses -- \$185.68

This was for long distance telephone, postage, taxis, couriers and photocopying.

E. Previous Bills Unpaid -- \$355.95

These were bills for October and November, 1988.

GRAND TOTAL DUE -- \$4,541.63.

Please call if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WILDER

By: Charles A. Hobbs

Enclosure

cc: Mr. Ed Lone Fight

Mr. Hugh Baker

/pas

LAW OFFICES

| 1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800
| CAROL L. BARBÉRO (DC) | WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006
| S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY) | (202) 783-5100
| HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA. OR) | TELECOPIER (202) 296-8834
| CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC) | FRANCES L. HORN (DC) |

PORTLAND OFFICE:

0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6

PORTLAND, OREGON 97201

(503) 242-0705

S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA. OR)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC)
MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
DEAN B. SUAGEE (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS RO. BOX 1447 SANTA FE. NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

February 27, 1989

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & ASSOCIATES PO. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS) OF COUNSEL

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

Mr. Hugh Baker, Treasurer
Three Affiliated Tribes of
the Ft. Berthold Reservation
New Town, North Dakota 58763

| FOR | LEGAL SERVICES from December | RENDERED 1, 1988 through January 31, 1989 | |
|-----|---------------------------------|--|-----------|
| | SERVICES | | 4,000.00* |
| | DISBURSEMENTS | \$ | 185.68* |
| | ~~~~ A I | | 4.185.68 |
| | IUIAL | | 4,100.00 |
| | BALANCE ON PR | REVIOUS STATEMENTS\$ | 355.95 |
| | | w w | |
| | TOTAL DUE | . | 4,541.63 |

^{*} See attached sheet for details.

Mr. Hugh Baker, Treasurer

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

December 1, 1988 through January 31, 1989

| | | | HOURS |
|----------|-----|---|-------|
| 12/07/88 | DBS | Teleconference with Kip Quale. | 0.10 |
| 12/12/88 | CAH | Review Yakima brief. | 0.20 |
| 12/16/88 | CAH | Call from Kip Quale re Basin matter; Letter to him. | 0.50 |
| 12/19/88 | CAH | NO CHARGE Teleconference with Steve Francis, Hugh Baker; Get bills together and drop off at Steve's hotel; Conference with PAS; Review bills; Draft rate amendment to contract. | 1.00 |
| 12/21/88 | DBS | Review file; Review correspondence. | 0.80 |
| 12/22/88 | DBS | Teleconference with Steve Moore, NARF. | 0.20 |
| 12/23/88 | DBS | Review file and draft outline for letter/brief. | 2.20 |
| 12/27/88 | DBS | Re-reading Echo Hawk article, Charrier case, checking case law, drafting letter to Hodel. | 4.80 |
| 12/28/88 | CAH | NO CHARGE Call Steve Francis re 638, talk to Donald; Conference with SBD re 638 group. | 0.50 |
| 12/28/88 | SBD | NO CHARGE Conference with CAH re Fort Berthold. | 0.20 |

| 12/28/88 | DBS | Draft letter and brief to Hodel. | 2.50 |
|----------|-----|--|------|
| 12/29/88 | DBS | Draft letter and brief to Hodel. | 2.00 |
| 12/30/88 | CAH | NO CHARGE Try to call Steve Francis. | 0.10 |
| 1/10/89 | CAH | NO CHARGE Attend Yakima argument at Supreme Court. | 3.00 |
| 1/10/89 | MMK | NO CHARGE Supreme Court argument in Yakima. | 2.30 |
| 1/11/89 | DBS | Draft letter to Hodel (changed to Swimmer), Conference with Kip Quale. | 5.00 |
| 1/12/89 | CAH | Review DBS's draft letter re remains. | 1.00 |
| 1/12/89 | DBS | Draft letter to Ross Swimmer re reburial. | 4.00 |
| 1/13/89 | KJF | Review draft memo re reburial issue to BIA and discuss with Dean. | 1.20 |
| 1/13/89 | DBS | Review CAH's notes on draft letter to Hodel. Teleconference with Kip Guale, Teleconference with Steve Moore. | 0.80 |
| 1/17/89 | KJF | Conference call with Kip Guale, Remina Yellowbird and Dean Suagee re reburial issue. | 1.50 |
| 1/17/89 | DBS | Teleconference with Kip Quale, Teleconference with Jerry Rogers (NPS). Prepare for conference call. Conference call with Kip Quale and Pam Yellow Bird. | 2.40 |
| 1/18/89 | DBS | Conference with Kip Quale, final editing of memo and letter to Swimmer. | 3.90 |

| | 1/19/89 | DBS | NO CHARGE Final proofing of letter and memorandum to Swimmer re reburial. | 0.20 | |
|-----|----------------------|------|--|-------|----------------|
| | 1/23/89 | DBS | NO CHARGE Returned call from Lone Fight. | 0.10 | |
| | 1/24/89 | KJF | Meeting at BIA with Ed Lone Fight, Dean Suagee, George Ferris, Don Sutherland re reburial issue. | 1.00 | |
| | 1/24/89 | DBS | NO CHARGE Telecon Leyton, Meeting with George Farris, Don Sutherland, Karen Funk and Ed Lone Fight. | 1.20 | |
| | 1/26/89 | DBS | NO CHARGE Teleconference with Yellow Bird. | 0.20 | |
| | 1/31/89 | KJF | Follow up call to Don Sutherland of BIA re Ft. Berthold's report on reburial issue; consultation with Bob Peregoy of NARF and Dean Suagee re same. | 0.60 | |
| | | | | 34.70 | \$ 3,000.00 |
| RE: | 638 Joint | Effo | rt | | |
| | 12/01/88- 1/31/89 | | Monitoring BIA revision of 638 regulations. | 13.40 | |
| | 1/01/09 | | 000 LeAnturiolia" | 13.40 | \$ 1,000.00 |
| | | | TOTAL SERVICES | | \$ 4,000.00 |

CAH - CHARLES A. HOBBS

SBD - S. BOBO DEAN

MMK - MARSHA KOSTURA

KJF - KAREN J. FUNK

DBS - DEAN B. SUAGEE

Mr. Hugh Baker, Treasurer

EXPENSES

| EXPENSE | DESCRIPTION | AMO | AMOUNT | | |
|--|---|-------------|---------------------------------------|--|--|
| 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 00 | 100, 400 to 100 to | *********** | · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · | | |
| Long distance calls | MONTH OF DECEMBER | \$ | 6.97 | | |
| | MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ | 11.32 | | |
| Postage | MONTH OF DECEMBER | \$ | 3.30 | | |
| | MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ | 6.33 | | |
| Local couriers | MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ | 12.35 | | |
| Local transportation | MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ | 11.50 | | |
| Photocopying | MONTH OF DECEMBER | \$ | 7.95 | | |
| | MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ | 97.05 | | |
| Long dist. courier | MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ | 28.25 | | |
| Printing bill credit | WILSON-EPES PRINTING | \$ | (42.85) | | |
| Portion of 638 exps. | MONTH OF DECEMBER | \$ | 13.37 | | |
| Portion of 638 exps. | MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ | 30.14 | | |
| | | w · | ~ ··· ··· ··· ··· ··· ··· ··· ··· | | |

EXPENSES

\$ 185.68

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC) S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY) JILL A. DE LA HUNT (AK) CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC) FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV) MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA) MICHAEL L. ROY (MA) JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX) THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC. MD) JERRY C. STRAUS (DC) LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

November 10, 1986

PORTLAND OFFICE: G-4 RIVER PLACE 0225 S. W. MONTGOMERY PORTLAND, OREGON 97201 (503) 242-0705

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER P.O. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & ROGERS 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA. NY. KS) MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ) KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS) OF COUNSEL

ROBERT J. MARTIN GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

 $\{ (A_{k}) \in S$

Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from September 1, 1986 through September 30, 1986

Mr. Hobbs 2.0 hours at \$105 per hour 210.00 388.50 Ms. Barbero 3.7 hours at \$105 per hour Ms. De La Hunt 10.3 hours at \$105 per hour 1,081.50 2.3 hours at \$ 40 per hour 92.00 Ms. Roy Total Fees 1,772.00* 24.21× Disbursements Total Due 1,796.21

See attached sheets for detail. 930/88

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

September 1, 1986 through September 30, 1986

| | | | HOURS |
|------------|----|--|-------|
| 09/02/86 C | LB | Memorandum to CAH re: Garrison. | 0.10 |
| 09/04/86 C | | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda re: events in Indian law. | 0.10 |
| 09/04/86 L | | Call the Subcommittee on Water Resources Appropriations re HR 6 Conferees. | 0.10 |
| 09/05/86 C | | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda re: events in Indian law. | 0.40 |
| 09/08/86 C | AH | Meeting with Alyce Spotted Bear, review a few pending matters and general prospects | 0.50 |
| 09/08/86 L | LR | Call Subcommittee on Water Resources re HR & Conferees; Memorandum to CLB. | 0.20 |
| 09/09/86 C | LB | Fro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda reevents in Indian law. | 0.20 |
| 09/09/86 L | LR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 09/10/86 L | LR | Call Subcommittee on Water Resources re HR 6 Conferees (nothing yet); Review Congressional Record. | 0.20 |
| • | | | |

| 09/11/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
|----------|-----|--|------|
| 09/12/86 | CAH | Conference with SBD re: BIA indirect cost problem, help draft telegram to Andrews. Call Alyce, Conference with SBD, dictate telegram | 0.80 |
| 09/12/86 | CLB | Teleconference with Ahmed Kooros; Memorandum to CAH re: Great Plains. | 0.40 |
| 09/15/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.20 |
| D9/16/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.50 |
| 09/17/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.30 |
| 09/17/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 09/18/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 09/19/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.40 |
| 09/19/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 09/19/86 | JAD | Land and water conservation fund; review file. | 0.60 |
| 09/22/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda reevents in Indian law. | 0.10 |
| 09/22/84 | LLR | Call Subcommittee on Water Resources re HR 6 conferees; Review Congressional Record. | 0.20 |

| 09/22/86 | JAD | Review file: land and water conservation materials. | 0.20 | |
|----------|-----|--|------|------------|
| 09/23/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 | |
| 09/24/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.60 | |
| 09/24/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 | |
| 09/24/86 | JAD | Research stats/regulations; land and water materials. | 4.70 | |
| 09/25/86 | CAH | Conference with SBD on 638 overhead allowances (HR 4174); try to call Alyce at New Town and NCAI convention in Phoenix | 0.70 | _ |
| 09/25/86 | CLB | Teleconference with Tillie Walker re: Three Affiliated Tribes jail and Garrison. | 0.20 | · <u>.</u> |
| 09/25/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 | |
| 09/25/86 | JAD | Research for land and water conservation; conference with Allan McKay re same. | 3.40 | |
| 09/26/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.20 | |
| 09/26/86 | JAD | Check for other stats, regs, programs. | 0.90 | . f |
| 09/29/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.40 | ٠ |
| 09/29/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Records. | 0.30 | |
| 09/30/84 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 | |
| 09/30/86 | JAD | Review new materials from Allan McKay. | 0.50 | · |
| | | TOTAL SERVICES | | \$ |
| | | | | |

CAH - CHARLES A. HOBBS CLB - CAROL L. BARBERO

JAD - JILL DE LA HUNT LLR - LYNDA L. ROY

\$ 1,772.00

DISBURSEMENTS:

| DISBURSEMENT | DESCRIPTION | AMOUNT | |
|--|--|--------------|-----------------------|
| Long distance calls Postage Photocopying | MONTH OF SEPTEMBER MONTH OF SEPTEMBER MONTH OF SEPTEMBER | \$ \$ | 14.69 0.67 8.85 |
| | TOTAL | \$ | 24.21 |

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100 PORTLAND OFFICE: G-4 RIVER PLACE O225 S. W. MONTGOMERY PORTLAND. OREGON 97201 (503) 242-0705

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
JILL A. DE LA HUNT (AK)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC, MD)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

November 28, 1986

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

FLORIDA AFFILIATE:
TWOROGER & SADER
P.O. BOX 11606
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339
(305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & ROGERS 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA. NY, KS) MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM. AZ) KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS) OF COUNSEL

ROBERT J. MARTIN GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

> Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from October 1, 1986 through October 31, 1986

| Mr. Ms. | Hobbs Dean Barbero Martin Roy | 2 4 5 | .8 hours .3 hours .7 hours | at \$105 at \$105 at \$ 80 | per hour per hour per hour per hour | • | 168.00 294.00 451.50 456.00 88.00 |
|------------|---|-------------|----------------------------------|----------------------------------|--|----|---|
| | | | ך | Total Fe | es | \$ | 1,457.50* |
| | | | Ţ. | Disburse | ments | ~~ | 43.66* |
| | | | ן | Total Du | e | \$ | 1,501.16 |

^{*} See attached sheets for detail.

PAGE 1

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

October 1, 1986 through October 31, 1986

| - | | HOURS |
|-------------|--|-------|
| 10/01/86 CL | B Teleconference with Paulette Hansen, Celeste & EDA re: forgiveness of EDA Four Bears loan and proof of same | 0.60 |
| 10/01/84 CL | B Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.20 |
| 10/01/86 LL | R Review Congressional Record; call Water Resources Subcommittee re HR 6 Conferees. | 0.20 |
| 10/02/86 LL | R Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 10/03/84 CL | B Teleconference with EOA; Teleconference with P. Hansen and letter to Senator Burdick re: Four Bears | 0.50 |
| 10/03/86 CL | B Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.70 |
| 10/03/86 LL | R Review Congressional Record. | 0.20 |
| 10/06/86 CL | B Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda revents in Indian law. | |
| 10/06/86 LL | R Review Congressional Record; call Water Resources Subcommittee re HR 6 Conferees Meeting with CLB. | 0.20 |

| 10/07/86 | RJM | Analyze proposed Senate language on Indian amendment, propose modified language, negotiate with staff | 1.50 |
|----------|-----|---|------|
| 10/07/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 10/08/86 | CAH | Conference with SBO re: 638 overhead cut off threat, call Alyce and Steve Francis, work out strategy, Conference with SBO | 1.20 |
| 10/08/86 | SBD | Teleconference with Fisher re: indirect cost & admin fee | 1.30 |
| 10/08/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 10/09/86 | SBD | Send letter to Steve Francis re: BIA and IHS re: indirect cost issues | 0.30 |
| 10/09/86 | RJM | Check status and analyze tribal amendment to Clean Water Act, changes in Conference | 1.50 |
| 10/09/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 10/10/86 | SBD | Teleconference with Steve 'Francis re: 638 | 0.40 |
| 10/10/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.30 |
| 10/10/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 10/13/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.30 |
| 10/13/86 | MLA | Memorandum to file on tribal CWA amendment, draft colloquy for Senate on intent of amendment | 1.10 |
| 10/14/86 | MLЯ | Draft colloquy on tribal amendment to CWA | 0.80 |
| 10/14/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.20 |

| | | TOTAL SERVICES | | \$ 1,457.50 |
|----------|-----|--|------|----------------|
| 10/31/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.50 | |
| 10/30/86 | CLB | Teleconference with White House to see if H.R. 6 signed yet; Note to LLR re: manitar of same. | 0.20 | |
| 10/30/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.50 | |
| 10/30/86 | CAH | Letter to client re: Four Bears restoration | 0.40 | |
| 10/22/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Records. | 0.20 | |
| 10/22/84 | SBO | Teleconference with Tribal Treasurer re: indirect costs problems | 0.40 | |
| 10/21/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | D.10 | |
| 10/21/86 | SBD | Conference with CAH re: admin fee | 0.40 | |
| 10/20/86 | | Review Congressional Records. | 0.30 | |
| 10/20/86 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.30 | |
| 10/17/86 | | Review Congressional Record. | 0.20 | |
| 10/16/66 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.10 | |
| 10/15/86 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 | |
| | | with Senate staff on tribal amendment to CWA | | |

0.80

10/15/86 RJM Draft and negotiate colloquy

CAH - CHARLES A. HOBBS

- SBD - S. BOBO DEAN

CLB - CAROL L. BARBERO

RJM - ROBERT J. MARTIN

LLR - LYNDA L. ROY

PAGE 4

DISBURSEMENTS:

| DISBURSEMENT | DESCRIPTION | AMOUNT | | |
|--|--|--------------|------------------------|--|
| Long distance calls Postage Photocopying | MONTH OF OCTOBER MONTH OF OCTOBER MONTH OF OCTOBER | \$ \$ | 23.85 4.66 15.15 | |
| | TOTAL | \$ | 43.66 | |

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
5. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC, MD)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

March 3, 1987

PORTLAND OFFICE-1630 S.W. HARBOR WAY, #401 PORTLAND, OREGON 97205 (503) 242-0705

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE:
ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS,
AMARANT & ROGERS
P.O. BOX 1447
SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501
(505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER P.O. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

> ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & ROGERS 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA. NY, KS)
MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC. FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)
OF COUNSEL

ROBERT J. MARTIN
GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR
(NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

Ms. Alyce Spotted Bear Chairman Tribal Business Council Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, ND 58763

Dear Alyce:

Enclosed is our statement for services and expenses incurred during January 1987. Please let us know if anyone has any questions.

Best regards,

HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WILDER

By: Charles A. Hobbs

Encl.

cc: Ms. Marilyn Hudson
BIA Administrative Officer

Tribal Treasurer

/ccw

MAK 00 1987

profite the second of a

And the second of the second o

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100

PORTLAND OFFICE:
G-4 RIVER PLACE
O225 S W MONTGOMERY
PORTLAND, OREGON 97201
(503) 242-0705

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
JILL A. DE LA HUNT (AK)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC, MD)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA. NY, KS) MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ) KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS) NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

February 28, 1987

FLORIDA AFFILIATE:
TWOROGER & SADER
P.O. 80X 11506
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339
(305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & ROGERS 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

ROBERT J. MARTIN
GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR
(NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

OF COUNSEL

Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from January 1, 1987 through January 31, 1987

Ms. Barbero 3.2 hours at \$105 per hour \$ 336.00 Mr. Roy 0.8 hours at \$105 per hour 84.00 Ms. Roy 10.7 hours at \$ 46 per hour 728.00 TOTAL FEES \$ 448.00*

DISBURSEMENTS \$ 16.91*

TOTAL DUE \$ 464.91

* See attached sheets for detail.

* Toto ener is come all as back made to the state of the

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

January 1, 1987 through January 31, 1987

| | | | HOURS |
|----------|-----|--|-------------------|
| 01/09/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | V _{0.10} |
| 01/12/87 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda re: events in Indian law. | VO.60 |
| 01/12/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 01/13/87 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda revents in Indian law. | 0.30 |
| 01/14/87 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda reevents in Indian law. | √0.50 |
| 01/14/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 01/15/87 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 9.20 |
| 01/15/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 01/16/87 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda revents in Indian law. | VO.20 |
| 01/20/87 | MLR | Call from Ed Hall re: tribal transportation legislation. Memorandum to SBD & JCS re: same | V _{0.20} |

| 01/21/87 | MLR | Proof memo to SBD | 90.10 |
|----------------------|---------|--|--------------|
| 01/21/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 01/23/87 | CLB | Promata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda re: events in Indian law. | 0.50 |
| 01/23/87 | MLR | Draft letter to Alyce Spotted re: FY 88 IPS allocation | 11.40 |
| 01/27/87 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda re: events in Indian law. | 0.20 |
| 01/28/87 | MI D | Review letter re: IPS | V0.10 |
| | 1 IlmiN | KEALEM LEFTEL LEFTLE | -0,10 |
| | | Review Congressional Record. | \o.10 |
| | LLR | | \ |
| 01/29/87 01/30/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda re: | 0.10 |

TOTAL SERVICES

\$ 448.00

CLB - CAROL L. BARBERO MLR - MICHAEL L. ROY LLR - LYNDA L. ROY

DISBURSEMENTS:

| DISBURSEMENT | DESCRIPTION | | AMOUNT | |
|--|--|-----------------------|-----------------------------|--|
| Long distance calls Postage Photocopying | MONTH OF JANUARY MONTH OF JANUARY MONTH OF JANUARY | \$ \$ \$ | 9.07 4.24 3.60 | |
| | TOTAL | \$ | 16.91 | |

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC, MD)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

March 16, 1987

PORTLAND OFFICE: 1630 S.W. HARBOR WAY, #401 PORTLAND, OREGON 97205 (503) 242-0705

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

FLORIDA AFFILIATE:
TWOROGER & SADER
P.O. BOX 11606
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339
(305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & ROGERS 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA, NY, KS) MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ) KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS) OF COUNSEL

ROBERT J. MARTIN
GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR
(NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

Ms. Alyce Spotted Bear Chairman Tribal Business Council Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, ND 58763

Dear Alyce:

Enclosed is our statement for services and expenses incurred during February 1987. Please let us know if anyone has any questions.

Best regards,

HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WILDER

By: Charles A. Hobbs

Encl.

cc: V Ms. Marilyn Hudson
BIA Administrative Officer

Tribal Treasurer

/ccw

iden in stage

LAW OFFICES

WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC) S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY) CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC) FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV) MARSHA KOSTURA (DC. PA) MICHAEL L. ROY (MA) JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX) THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC. MD) JERRY C. STRAUS (DC) LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 (202) 783-5100

March 16, 1987

PORTLAND OFFICE: 1630 S.W. HARBOR WAY. #401 PORTLAND, OREGON 97205 (503) 242-0705

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWORGGER & SADER P.O. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & ROGERS 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA, NY, KS) MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ) KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS) OF COUNSEL

ROBERT J. MARTIN GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

> Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from February 1, 1987 through February 28, 1987

| Mr. Hobbs D.8 Ms. Barbero 1.6 Ms. Roy D.9 | hours at \$105 per hour hours at \$105 per hour hours at \$ 40 per hour | \$ 84.00 168.00 36.00 |
|---|---|--------------------------------|
| | TOTAL SERVICES | \$ 288.00* |
| | DISBURSEMENTS | \$ 10.73* |
| | TOTAL DUE | \$ 298.93 |

See attached sheets for detail.

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

February 1, 1987 through February 28, 1987

| | | | HOURS |
|----------|-----|--|---------|
| 02/02/87 | CLB | Revised draft of letter to Swimmer re: budget consultation with tribes and conferences with SBD re: same. | 0.30 |
| 02/03/87 | CLB | Final work on letter to Swimmer re: budget consultation. | 0.10 \ |
| 02/03/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 02/04/67 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.30 • |
| 02/04/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 02/05/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10% |
| 02/06/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record & Federal Register. | 0.20 🤍 |
| 02/18/87 | CLB | Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.20 |
| 02/18/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 |
| 02/19/87 | CAH | Research into prior Chairpersons at Rose Wicker's request | 0.30), |
| 02/20/87 | LLR | Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 📎 |

| D2/23/67 | CLB Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | Q | |
|----------|--|----------|-------|
| 02/24/87 | CAH Call from Pete Segall re: Highway Authority Act, HR 2 and 5 387; call Alyce re: her calling Burdick to urge \$90 m instead of \$75 million | 0.50 ° | |
| 02/24/87 | CLB Pro-rata portion of time spent on research, preparation and review of General Memoranda resevents in Indian law. | 0.40 | |
| 02/25/87 | LLR Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 | |
| 02/27/87 | LLR Review Congressional Record. | 0.10 | ; |

TOTAL SERVICES \$ 288.00

CAH - CHARLES A. HOBBS CLB - CAROL L. BARBERO LLR - LYNDA L. ROY

DISBURSEMENTS:

| DISBURSEMENT | | DESCRIPTION | | | | AMOUNT | |
|--|-------|-------------|----|----------------------------------|----------|----------------------|--|
| Long distance Postage Photocopying | calls | MONTH (| 0F | FEBRUARY FEBRUARY FEBRUARY | \$ \$ | 3.39 1.24 6.30 | |
| | | | | тот | AL \$ | 10.93 | |

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC) S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY) HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR) CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC) FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV) MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA) MICHAEL L. ROY (DC, MA) JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX) JERRY C. STRAUS (DC) HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND) LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ) KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

OF COUNSEL

(202) 783-5100

February 26, 1988

PORTLAND OFFICE: 0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6 PORTLAND, OREGON 97201 (503) 242-0705

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER P.O. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

Mr. Edward Lone Fight Chairman Three Affiliated Tribes of the Fort Berthold Reservation 58763 New Town, N.D.

Dear Ed:

Attached is a bill for some work we did on the reburial question. As you see, most of the work was done by Karen Funk, whose rate is \$55 per hour.

We also note that we have outstanding bills for \$6,434.59 for past work, and would appreicate some payments toward this too, if possible.

Sincerely,

HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WILDER

Charles A. Hobbs By:

Enclosure

Ms. Marilyn Hudson cc:

BIA Administrative Officer

Tribal Treasurer /

/pas

LAW OFFICES

WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC) S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY) HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR) CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC) FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV) MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA) MICHAEL L. ROY (DC, MA) JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX) THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC, MD) JERRY C. STRAUS (DC) LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 (202) 783-5100

PORTLAND OFFICE: 1630 S.W. HARBOR WAY, #401 PORTLAND, OREGON 97205 (503) 242-0705

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA, NY, KS) MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ) KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL) ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS) OF COUNSEL

February 24, 1988

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER P.O. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 9950I (907) 277-8611

Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from January 1, 1988 through January 31, 1988 SERVICES------330.00*

See attached sheets for detail.

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

January 1, 1988 through January 31, 1988

| | | | TIOUNG |
|----------|-----|---|--------|
| 01/25/88 | CAH | Call from Kip Quale re: letter re: burial; Conference with KJF re: how to proceed. | |
| 01/25/88 | KJF | Conference with CAH and Kip Quale re: reburial of Indian remains in North Dakota. | 0.50 |
| 01/27/88 | KJF | Calls to NARF, Friends Committee, NCAI, Bureau of Catholic Indian Missions, Governor's Interstate Indian Council re: letter of supporet for Ft. Berthold on reburial issue. | 1.50 |
| 01/28/88 | KJF | Calls to Friends Committee, NARF, Bureau of Catholic Indian Missions, Governor's Interstate Council, NCAI re: letters of support for Ft. Berthold on reburial issue; Preparation of HSDW letter for Ft. Berthold on reburial. | 2.00 |
| 01/29/88 | KJF | Finalize and send letters re: reburial to Ft. Berthold. | 1.00 |

TOTAL SERVICES \$ 330.00

CAH - CHARLES A. HOBBS KJF - KAREN J. FUNK

LAW OFFICES

IBI9 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100 TELECOPIER (202) 296-8834

PORTLAND OFFICE:
0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6
PORTLAND, OREGON 97201
(503) 242-0705

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (DC, MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

March 31, 1988

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)
OF COUNSEL

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER RO. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR) ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

Mr. Hugh Baker Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

Dear Hugh:

Here is our bill for some time Karen spent on the reburial matter in February. Let us know if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WILDER

By: Charles A. Hobbs

Enclosure

/pas

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100 TELECOPIER (202) 296-8834

March 31, 1988

PORTLAND OFFICE:
0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6
PORTLAND, OREGON 97201
(503) 242-0705

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (DC, MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE:
ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS
AMARANT & ROGERS
RO. BOX 1447
SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501
(505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)
OF COUNSEL

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER RO. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

KAREN J. FUNK
GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR
(NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

| FOR LEGAL SERVICES from February | RENDERED 1, 1988 through Februa | ary 29, 1988 | |
|----------------------------------|--|---------------------------------|-----------------|
| SERVICES | . Sinn sinn nest steel | <u> </u> | 220.00 * |
| DISBURSEMENTS | | \$ | 96.00* |
| TOTAL | | \$ (| 316.00 |
| BALANCE ON PRE | VIOUS STATEMENTS | \$ | 6,764.59 |
| TOTAL DUE | | Ann ann ann ann ann ann ann ann | 7,080.59 |

* See attached sheets for detail.

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

February 1, 1988 through February 29, 1988

| | | | HOURS |
|----------|-----|---|-------|
| 02/11/88 | KJF | Conference with Kip Quale and Sara Vogel re: reburial issues at Ft. Berthold. | 1.50 |
| 02/12/88 | KJF | Gather, xerox and mail material to N.D. Attorney General's office, N.D. Historical Society and Kip Quale re: reburial issues in North Dakota. | 2.00 |
| 02/19/88 | KJF | Mail Smithsonian information to Ed Lone Fight. | 0.50 |

TOTAL SERVICES \$ 220.00

KJF - KAREN J. FUNK

DISBURSEMENTS:

| DISBURSEMENT | DESCRIPT | DESCRIPTION | | AMOUNT | |
|--|-------------------|--|----------------|---------------------------------|--|
| Long distance calls Postage Local couriers Photocopying | MONTH OF MONTH OF | FEBRUARY FEBRUARY FEBRUARY FEBRUARY | \$ \$ \$ | 17.78 7.67 10.00 60.55 | |
| | | TOTAL | \$ | 96.00 | |

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100 TELECOPIER (202) 296-8834

May 24, 1988

PORTLAND OFFICE:
0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6
PORTLAND, OREGON 97201
(503) 242-0705

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER PO. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)
OF COUNSEL

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)

S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)

CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC) FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)

MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)

MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)

JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)

LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

MICHAEL L. ROY (DC, MA)

JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)

HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

> Mr. Hugh Baker Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, ND 58763

Dear Hugh:

Here is a bill for some current work. It is trivial, but there is still a backlog of \$7,080.59. We hope you can find some way to make some payments on this.

Best regards,

HOBBS, STRAUS, DEAN & WILDER

By: Charles A. Hobbs

Encl.

cc: Mr. Ed Lone Fight, Chairman

Ms. Marilyn Hudson, BIA Administrative

Officer

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100 TELECOPIER (202) 296-8834

May 23, 1988

PORTLAND OFFICE:
0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6
PORTLAND, OREGON 97201
(503) 242-0705

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (DC, MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER RO. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

OF COUNSEL

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

> Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

| FOR | LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from March 1, 1988 through April 30, | 1988 | |
|-----|--|------|----------|
| | SERVICES | | 11.00* |
| | DISBURSEMENTS | \$ | 27.85* |
| | TOTAL | \$ | 38.85 |
| | BALANCE ON PREVIOUS STATEMENTS | \$ | 7,080.59 |
| | TOTAL DUE | \$ | 7,119.44 |

^{*} See attached sheets for detail.

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

March 1, 1988 through April 30, 1988

HOURS

03/09/88 KJF Send materials to Kip Quale and 0.20 Sarah Vogel re: reburial issue at Ft. Berthold.

TOTAL SERVICES

11.00

KJF - KAREN J. FUNK

DISBURSEMENTS:

| DISBURSEMENT | DESCRIPTION | AMOUNT | |
|--|--|----------------|-----------------------|
| Long distance calls Postage Photocopying | MONTH OF MARCH MONTH OF MARCH MONTH OF MARCH | \$ \$ \$ | 4.99 4.86 18.00 |
| | TOTAL | \$ | 27.85 |

LAW OFFICES

1819 H STREET, N.W., SUITE 800 WASHINGTON, D.C. 20006 (202) 783-5100 TELECOPIER (202) 296-8834

June 16, 1988

PORTLAND OFFICE:
0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6
PORTLAND, OREGON 97201
(503) 242-0705

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)
S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV)
MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
MICHAEL L. ROY (DC, MA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS AMARANT & ROGERS P.O. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)
OF COUNSEL

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: TWOROGER & SADER RO. BOX 11606 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339 (305) 565-8990

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR) ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

Fort Berthold General Three Affiliated Tribes New Town, N.D. 58763

| FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from May 1, 1988 through May 31, 1988 | |
|---|----------------|
| SERVICES | \$ 104.50* |
| DISBURSEMENTS | \$ 7.70* |
| TOTAL | \$ 112.20 |
| BALANCE ON PREVIOUS STATEMENTS | \$ 7,119.44 |
| TOTAL DUE | \$ 7,231.64 |

^{*} See attached sheets for detail.

PAGE 1

Fort Berthold General

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

May 1, 1988 through May 31, 1988

| 05/11/88 | | Conversation with Kip Quale and preparation of letter for Three Affiliated Tribes re: reburial issue. | 0.80 | |
|----------|-----|---|------|--|
| 05/12/88 | CAH | Conference with KJF; Letter to State Historical Society on reinterment of remains. | 0.30 | |
| 05/27/88 | KJF | Send museum bill materials to Kip Quale. | 0.50 | |
| | | | | |

TOTAL SERVICES \$ 104.50

HOURS

CAH - CHARLES A. HOBBS KJF - KAREN J. FUNK

DISBURSEMENTS:

| DISBURSEMENT | DESCRIPTION | | AMOUNT | | |
|--|--|----------------|----------------------|--|--|
| Long distance calls Postage Photocopying | MONTH OF MAY MONTH OF MAY MONTH OF MAY | \$ \$ \$ | 0.29 3.96 3.45 | | |
| | | TOTAL \$ | 7.70 | | |

LAW OFFICES

CAROL L. BARBERO (DC)

S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)

HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)

CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)

FRANCES L. HORN (DC)

PORTLAND OFFICE:
0225 S.W. MONTGOMERY STREET, #6
PORTLAND, OREGON 97201
(503) 242-0705

S. BOBO DEAN (DC, NY)
HAROLD M. GROSS (DC, CA, OR)
CHARLES A. HOBBS (DC)
FRANCES L. HORN (DC)
MATTHEW S. JAFFE (DC, MD)
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC, PA)
JOSEPH J. B. RYAN (DC, TX)
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC)
DEAN B. SUAGEE (DC)
HANS WALKER, JR. (DC, ND)
LEROY W. WILDER (OR, DC, CA)

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE; ROTH, VAN AMBERG, GROSS, AMARANT & ROGERS RO. BOX 1447 SANTA FE, NEW MEXICO 87501 (505) 988-8979 AND 983-7319

November 21, 1988

FLORIDA AFFILIATE:
TWOROGER & ASSOCIATES
PO. BOX 11606
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33339
(305) 565-8990

ALASKA AFFILIATE: WAGSTAFF, POPE & CLOCKSIN 912 WEST SIXTH AVENUE ANCHORAGE, ALASKA 99501 (907) 277-8611

MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM, AZ)
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC, FL)
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (AK, KS)
OF COUNSEL

KAREN J. FUNK GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS COORDINATOR (NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR)

Mr. Hugh Baker, Treasurer
Three Affiliated Tribes of
the Ft. Berthold Reservation
New Town, North Dakota 58763

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED from September 1, 1988 through October 31, 1988 Amicus brief in Yakima case (At straight time rates the work computes out to \$6,512; however the agreed budget is \$4,000)-----\$ 4,000.00* Basin Electric matter -- talks with Basin and Interior officials 1,089.00 DISBURSEMENTS-----\$ 1,037.60* €6,126.60 3,231.64 (2,000.00)7,358.24

See attached sheet for details.

Mr. Hugh Baker, Treasurer

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES

September 1, 1988 through October 31, 1988

| | | | HOURS |
|----------|-----|--|-------|
| 9/14/88 | MMK | Reading briefs on Whiteside. | 2.00 |
| 9/15/88 | CAH | Conference with MK on strategy; Work on fact portion of brief, re tribal history; Conference with HCW; Call from MK from home. | 2.00 |
| 9/15/88 | MMK | Conference with HW; Conference with CAH; reading briefs; Teleconference with HW. | 6.50 |
| 9/21/88 | MMK | Work on draft brief. | 2.00 |
| 9/30/88 | MMK | Work on brief; Conference with CAH; Conference with HW; TCW K. Quale; letter to C. Flowers. | 7.00 |
| 10/03/88 | MMK | Work on amicus brief. | 5.00 |
| 10/03/88 | HMG | Assist MK re research on amicus brief. | 2.00 |
| 10/04/88 | MMK | Work on brief; Teleconference with K. Guale. | 0.60 |
| 10/05/88 | CAH | Conference with MK re mapping Fort Berthold Reservation, history of Tribe; Review her draft. | 1.00 |

| 10/05/88 | MMK | Work on brief; Teleconference with Quale; Teleconference, telex re zoning. | 5.00 |
|----------|-----|--|------|
| 10/06/88 | CAH | Work on brief. | 1.50 |
| 10/06/88 | MMK | Work on brief and map; Conference with CAH; review cert. rules. | 1.50 |
| 10/07/88 | CAH | Edit draft of amicus brief in Yakima case. | 1.30 |
| 10/07/88 | MMK | Work on brief; Teleconference with Tex Longbear and Rich; Conference with HW; Teleconference with M. Cox; Conference with CAH. | 4.00 |
| 10/07/88 | нсы | Two conferences with MK re brief. | 0.40 |
| 10/11/88 | CAH | Review Review MK's draft of brief. | 1.20 |
| 10/11/88 | MMK | Work on brief; send to Tribe. | 0.70 |
| 10/12/88 | CAH | Review brief; Try to call Quale re letter. | 0.20 |
| 10/13/88 | MMK | Teleconference with R. Gonzales re consent; sent missing page out. | 0.70 |
| 10/14/88 | MMK | Teleconference with K. Quale. | 0.20 |
| 10/19/88 | CAH | Conference with MK on amicus brief. | 0.50 |
| 10/19/88 | MMK | Teleconference with K. Guale; Conference with CAH; edit of brief; reading cases. | 3.00 |

| 10/20/88 | CAH | Review brief; Conference with HMG and MK re need for improvements in Yakima's brief. | 2.20 | |
|----------|-----|--|-------|----------------|
| 10/20/88 | MMK | Reading Yakima Tribe's brief; Conference with HW, HMG, CAH; Teleconference with Quale; Teleconference with Weaver; editing and cite checking brief. | 4.50 | |
| 10/20/88 | HCW | Two conferences with MK re brief. | 0.50 | |
| 10/21/88 | CAH | Work on AC brief. | 0.80 | |
| 10/21/88 | MMK | Conference with CAH, HW re brief. | 0.70 | |
| 10/24/88 | CAH | Teleconference with Tim, Yakima attorney, and HCW. | 0.50 | |
| 10/24/88 | HCW | Teleconference with Tim Weaver and CAH. | 0.50 | |
| 10/26/88 | CAH | Call printer re schedule. | 0.20 | |
| 10/28/88 | CAH | Call from Hugh Baker re Basin Electric deal; Brief MSJ; Prepare to file suit to enjoin deal; Many calls to and from Chris Kinney, Mark Anderson; Help MSJ draft complaint. | 5.30 | |
| 10/28/88 | MSJ | Conference with CAH re TRO, phone conversations with Hugh Baker, Chris Kinney; Draft complaint and TRO; Review Faxed materials. | 4.60 | |
| 10/31/88 | MMK | Editing amicus brief. | 1.00 | |
| | | | 69.10 | \$ 5,089.00 |
| | | TOTAL SERVICES | | \$ 5,089.00 |

PAGE 5

CAH - CHARLES A. HOBBS

MMK - MARSHA KOSTURA

HCW - HANS C. WALKER, JR.

HMG - HAROLD M. GROSS

MSJ - MATTHEW S. JAFFE

Mr. Hugh Baker, Treasurer

EXPENSES

| EXPENSE | DESCRIPTION | | | A | AMOUNT | |
|-----------------------|-------------|----|---------------------------------------|----|----------|--|
| | | | · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · | | | |
| Long distance calls | MONTH | OF | JULY | \$ | 0.58 | |
| | MONTH | OF | AUGUST | \$ | 9.54 | |
| | MONTH | OF | SEPTEMBER | \$ | 2.01 | |
| | MONTH | OF | OCTOBER | \$ | 32.42 | |
| Postage | MONTH | OF | AUGUST | \$ | 0.28 | |
| | MONTH | OF | OCTOBER | \$ | 0.94 | |
| Photocopying | MONTH | OF | AUGUST | \$ | 1.80 | |
| | MONTH | OF | SEPTEMBER | \$ | 6.90 | |
| | MONTH | OF | OCTOBER | \$ | 54.90 | |
| Long dist. courier | MONTH | OF | OCTOBER | \$ | 51.00 | |
| Telecopying | MONTH | OF | OCTOBER | \$ | 8.00 | |
| Secretarial overtime | MONTH | OF | OCTOBER | \$ | 9.23 | |
| Printer's bill, amicu | s brie | f | | \$ | 860.00 | |
| | | | | | | |
| | | EX | PENSES | \$ | 1,037.60 | |